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(g) For a vessel without sheer, the 
freeing port area must be increased by 
50 percent. 

(h) The area of the freeing ports on a 
vessel that operates on protected wa-
ters need only be 50 percent of the area 
required by paragraphs (c) or (d) of this 
section. 

(i) Freeing port covers are permitted 
provided that the freeing port area re-
quired by this section is not diminished 
and the covers are constructed and 
fitted so that water will readily flow 
outboard but not inboard. 

[CGD 88–079, 56 FR 40393, Aug. 14, 1991, as 

amended by CGD 96–046, 61 FR 57276, Nov. 5, 

1996] 

§ 28.560 Watertight and weathertight 
integrity. 

(a) Each opening in a deck or a bulk-
head that is exposed to weather must 
be fitted with a weathertight or a wa-
tertight closure device. 

(b) Except as provided in paragraphs 
(c) through (f) of this section, each 
opening in a deck or a bulkhead that is 
exposed to weather must be fitted with 
a watertight coaming as follows: 

(1) For a vessel 79 feet (24 meters) or 
more in length, the coaming must be at 
least 24 inches (0.61 meters) in height; 
or 

(2) For a vessel less than 79 feet (24 
meters) in length, the coaming must be 
at least 12 inches (0.30 meters) in 
height. 

(c) A coaming to a fish hold that is 
under constant attention when the clo-
sure is not in place need only be 6 
inches (0.15 meters) in height. 

(d) The coaming of an opening fitted 
with a quick-acting watertight closure 
device need only be of sufficient height 
to accommodate the device. 

(e) Except on an exposed forecastle 

deck, a coaming is not required on a 

deck above the lowest weather deck. 

(f) Each window and portlight located 

below the first deck above the lowest 

weather deck must be provided with an 

inside deadlight. Each deadlight must 

be efficient, hinged, and arranged so 

that it can be effectively closed water-

tight. 

(g) An opening in a vessel below the 

weather deck which is used for dis-

charging water or debris resulting from 

processing or sorting operations must 

be fitted with a means to ensure the 

opening can be closed weathertight. 

This means of closing must be operable 

from a location which is outside the 

space containing the opening. 

§ 28.565 Water on deck. 

(a) Each vessel with bulwarks must 

comply with the requirements of this 

section. 

(b) Except for a vessel that operates 

on protected waters, the residual right-

ing energy, ‘‘b’’ in Figure 28.565, must 

not be less than the water on deck 

heeling energy, ‘‘a’’ in Figure 28.565. 

(c) The water on deck heeling energy 

must be determined assuming the fol-

lowing: 

(1) The deck well is filled to the top 

of the bulwark at its lowest point and 

the vessel heeled to the angle at which 

this point is immersed; 

(2) Water does not run off through 

the freeing ports; 

(3) Vessel trim and displacement are 

constant and equal to the values of the 

vessel without the water on deck; and 

(4) Water in the well is free to run-off 

over the top of the bulwark. 

(d) The residual righting energy is 

the righting energy from the value 

where the righting arm equals the 

water on deck heeling arm up to the 

lesser of the values of 40° (0.70 radians) 

of heel or the downflooding angle. 
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